
Resolution No. 86-69-C 

RESOLUTION OF THE GOVERNING BODY OF 
THE THREE AFFILIATED TRIBES OF THE 

FORT BERTHOLD RESERVATION 

WHEREAS, This Nation, having accepted the Indian Reorganization Act of June 18, 
1934, and the authority under said Act; and 

VJHEREAS, The Constitution of the Three Affiliated Tribes generally authorizes and 
empowers the Tribal Business Council to engage in activites on behalf of 
and in the Interest of the welfare and benefit of the Tribes and of the 
enrolled members thereof; and 

WHEREAS, The Hobbs, Straus, Dean & Wilder Law Office has submitted a vouchers for 
payment of legal services and expenses incurred during the month of 
March 1986. (Description of Services attached). 

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED That the Tribal Business Council hereby authorizes 
payment of $24,273.98 for services rendered during the month of March 
1986 to Hobbs, Straus, Dean & Wilder Law Firm. 

£ Ê  II 1 Z i Ĉ  A I I £ ̂  

I, the undersigned, as Secretary of the Tribal Business Council of the Three 
Affiliated Tribes of the Fort Berthold Reservation, hereby certify that the Tribal 
Business Council is composed of II Members of whom 7 constitutes a quorum, I j 
were present at a Special Meeting; thereof duly called, noticed, convened, and 
held on the 24th day of April, 1986; that the foregiong resolution was duly adopted 
at such meeting by the affirmative vote of /Q Members, (^ Members opposed, 

j Members abstaining, (^ Members not voting, and that said resolution has not 
been rescinded or amended in any way. 

Chairperson Vot ing Wril" VITHUE 

Dated this ̂  clay of April, 1986. 

ATTEST! 

SEC:^TARY, 
TRIBAL BUSIN 

La. nAfe--^ 
CHAIRPERSON, ALYCEI SPOTTED BEAR 
TRIBAL BUSINESS COUNCIL 
THREE AFFILIATED TRIBES 
FORT BERTHOLD RESERVATION 



CAROL L. BARBERO (DC) 
S. BOBO DEAN (DC. NY) 
CHARLES A. HO BBS (DC) 
FRANCES L. HORN (DC, WV) 
MARSHA KOSTURA (DC. PA) 
JOSEPH J . B. RYAN (DC. TX) 
THEODORE A. SHIELDS (DC. MD) 
JERRY C. STRAUS (DC) 
L E R O Y W . WILDER (OR. DC, CA) 

HoBBS, S T R A U S , D E A N & W I L D E R 
LAW OFFICES 

I 8 i 9 H STREET, N.W., SUITE SOO 

WASHINGTON. D.C. 3 0 0 0 6 

(202 ) 7 8 3 - 5 I O O 

MIRIAM L. CHESSLIN (WA. NY, KS) 
MICHAEL P. GROSS (NM. A2) 
KENNETH F. TWOROGER (DC. FL) 
ROBERT H. WAGSTAFF (KS. AK) 

OF COUNSEL 

ROBERT J . MARTIN 
COVERNMeNTAL AFFAIRS COOROtNATOR 

(NOT ADMITTED TO ANY BAR) 

A p r 1 1 , 1966 

PORTLAND OFFICE: 
0 2 2 S S. W. M O N T G O M E R Y . NO. • 

P O R T L A N D . OREGON 9 7 3 0 1 

(S03) 2.42-0703 

NEW MEXICO AFFILIATE: 
R O T H . VAN AM BERG, G R O S S . 

AMARANT & ROGERS 
P.O. BOX 1 4 4 7 

SANTA FE. NEW MEXICO 8 7 5 0 1 
( S O S ) 9 S a - S 9 7 9 A N D 9 3 3 - 7 3 1 9 

FLORIDA AFFILIATE: 
TWOROGER. SADER & FERRELL 

P.O. BOX I I 6 0 6 
F O R T LAUDERDALE. FLORIDA 3 3 3 3 9 

(305) 5 6 S - a 9 9 0 

ALASKA AFFILIATE: 
WAGSTAFF. POPE & ROGERS 

9 1 2 W E S T SIXTH AVENUE 
ANCHORAGE. ALASKA 9 9 5 0 I 

( 9 0 7 ) 2 7 7 - 8 6 1 1 

l-art Berthaid General 
Three Affiliated Tribes 
New Town) N.D. 58763 

•OR LEGAL BIERŝ ICEb RENDERED 
from March 1; 1986 through March 31; 1986 

Mr, Habbs 25.7 hours at $105 per hour 
Ms, Hern Q.4 haurs at $1D5 psr hour 
Mr. Martin 47. D hours at $ 8(3 per hour 
Ms. Sarbera 86.3 hours at $105 per hour 
Ms. De La i-iunt 78.7 hours at $1D5 per hour 
Ms. Ray 2.7 hours at $ 4Q per hour 

Tata • ee s 

$ 2;698.5D 
42.00 

3 ; 7 6 0 . o n 
9;G61.50 
8;263.5D 

108.00 

$ 23.933.50 5̂  

s ID u r B e m e n t s 34D.48->f 

Total Due $ 24,273.93 

See attachec -far d e t, a i 
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Fart Berthald General 

DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES 

Marc'n 1; 1986 through March 31; 1986 

D3/D3/B6 

03/04/86 

Q3/i34/86 

03/04/66 

03/04/86 

03/05/86 

D3/D5/S6 

03/05/86 

03/06/86 

CLB At DOE reviewing Great Plains 
Project d D c u m e n 15; C o n t e r e n c e 
w,i th PAS re: court decision on 
Project. 

CAH Cai i tram Kaaras re: 
9 a s i f i c a t i a n P i a r, t > m e m a t a R J M 
and CLBi C a n f e r e n c e w i t h CLB 

CLB L a n s c a n f e r e n c e w i t h JAD re-
G r e a t P l a i n s P r o j e c t ; R e a d i n g 
G A O r e p o r t on s a m e ; SuiDsequent 

HOURS 

2.00 

conferences w th JAD and CAH. 

LLi^ Review Congress i ona i Records. 

JAD Conference with CLE^ reading 
coal sasificatian materials 

CLB Canference with JAD and study 
documents re- Great i^lainsi 
Teiecons with Gas Research 
Association rs- NG matters. 
Pro-rata portion of 
time spent on r e seai^ ch > 
preparation and review of 
General îl e m o r a n d a re- events 
Indian law. 

!~LR Review Co n g r s s s i D n a i Re c i3 r d . 

JAD Conference with CL£^ i ca i I R. 
Sci-i i i f ; reading mat.er i a I S 

0 .50 

2 . SO 

D,2D 

4.50 

3 .70 

a, 1D 

4i. . D U 

C L B At D O E with JAD to r e v i e w G r e a t 2.5C 
i- i a i n 5 d 0 c ij sn e n 15 ; C o n f e r s n c e 
with P A S re- nat:eoaai< on s a m e . 
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Q3/D6/B6 RJM Review North Dakota^s primary 2.2D 
status under SMCRA and status 
of tribal amendment 

03/06/8.^ LLR Review Congress i ana I Record. D . 10 

D3/D6/86 JAD trip to DOE, read materials 2.20 

03/07/a^ CAH Try to call Alyce, John 0.80 
Charging re- bingo bill coming 
to vote next Thursday. CaI i 
Doug Norel i of Dorgan-'s office 

03/07/86 CLB Warl<ing an mema rs- Great 2.30 
Plains; Conference w i t l-i JAD and 
RJM; Review materials from 8IA 
re: constitutional amendment, 

03/07/86 LLR Review Congressional Record. 0.20 

D3/D7/66 JAD Draft coai i< memo; read K. edit 6.3D 
Canf w/CLB 

Q3/D8/86 CLB Finished dictating/editing memo 2.ID 
cm Great Plains, P r a - r a t e p a r t i ci n 
D f t i m e s p e n t a n r e s e a r c h > 
preparation and review of 
Genera i. Memaranda re • e v e n t s i n 
Indian law. 

D3/1D/B6 CAH Conference with CLi3, JCS re: 7.DD 
bingo bill; Meeting with 
l<DDras> CLB, JAD, RJM ris • Great 
Plains proposal. Met most of 
the day. 

03/10/86 CLB Meetings re- Great Plains 6.50 
Project) Review coal. 
a g r e e m e n t s . Conf w/ JAD 

D3/1D/66 RJM Meeting with A. K o o r a s , CLB, 7.2u 
CAH and JAD on Great Plains 
b u y out; r e V i e w M o b i I jet fuel 
propositlan 

D3/1D/66 LLR Review Congress i ona i Re-cord, D.ID 

03/10/86 JAD Conference with CLBi Long 6.5D 
c i:i n f e r e n c e wit h RJM, CLB > CAH 
Ahmed Kooras 



PAGE 3 

03/11/66 CAH Can-fere nee witl-i CLB re- bingo 
bill; call Daug Norelij analyze 
bill and latest amendments. 
Conference with JCS 8< CLB re; 
g a s i -f i c a t i D n 

03/11/86 CLB Working on Great Plains 
Project) Tracked down F'ERC 
order . 

03/11/86 LLR Review Congressional Record. 

03/11/86 JAD Conference with CLB 

03/12/86 CLB Conferences with JAD and CAH 
re• Great Plains matters. 

1 .20 

03/12/86 RJM D e V e i D p legislative history for 
tribal amendments to Safe 
Drinking Water Act and 
Super fund lobby staff far 
c a n f e r e n c e 

1 .DO 

0.10 

0.30 

0.80 

5,10 

03/12/86 

03/12/86 

LLR 

JAD 

03/13/86 CAH 

R e V i e w C c n g r e 53 s i a n a ! R e c a r cl . 

t.r i P to D O E ; r e a d m a t e r i a i s ; 
c D n f w/CLF3 

T e l e c o n f e r e n c e w i 't h N a r e I i r e 
b i n g o bill 

Li , J. Li 

6.3D 

0.30 

03/13/86 RJM Deveiop arguments for 5% tribal 5.20 
set aside in Safe Drinking 
Water Act legislation; discuss 
with JCS and Congressional 
51. a f f 

03/13/86 

03/14/86 

03/14/86 

03/14/86 

03/15/86 

LLR 

CLB 

RJM 

LLR 

CL3 

R e v i e w C o n g r e s s i o n a l R e c o r d . D.IQ 

C a n t i n u e d work an G r e a t P l a i n s 2 .30 
P r D j e c t. 

R e v i e w Mobi i r e p o r t an fuel 2 .80 
p l a n t ; d i s c u s s w i t l-i A . i< o • r o s 

R e v i e w C o n g r ig s s i o n a I R e c o r d . Q . 1G 

Reading d u c u m e n t s re- Great 3.80 
P i a I n 3 p r a j e c t . 



PAGE 4 

D3/17/6(£i CAH i?(-?k/'iew Congress i ana i Record 
4 Bears bill; sett i na 
legislative history. Also 
Schiif letter to Jill re• ca 
reserves* confer with CLB an 
JAD re- same. Note bingo bi 
put D+f unti I at least Apr! i 
calI Dau9 Narel1 re- same. 
Also mention to Doug the 
progress of the 4 Bear bill 
Senate 

on 

al 
d 
I I 
7, 

I n 

2.20 

03/17/86 CAH Review CLB draft letter on 
bingo development in House. 
Conference with RJM re-
gasification; also conf w/JAD 

0.20 

03/17/86 CLB Pra-rate portion of time spent 
on research, preparation and 
review of General Memoranda re-
even t. s in India n law. 

G.5D 

03/17/86 CLB Review Senate debate an Four 
3C5ai" s -L r an s f e r i Con f e r ence s 
with RJM; JAD artd CAH re- Great 
Plains. 

2.5u 

03/17/86 LLR Review Congressional Record re 
Garrison Dam Project. 

0.50 

03/17/86 

D3/ie/86 

03/16/86 

03/18/86 

JAD Conference with CLB; CAH 

CLB Assignments to JAD re- Great 
Plains. 

Review Congressional Record. LLR 

JAD Reading materials; Conference 
w i th CLB 

1 .30 

D.4D 

D. ID 

3.30 

03/19/86 CAH Teleconference with Alyce with 
RJM to see about meet Ing with 
Swimmer on gasification; later 
changed to Frank Ryan; fallow 
up 

1 .00 

D3/19/S6 CLI3 Great Plains work; Conference 
and teiecan with Alyce and CAH 
r e • Garrison 1 n d i a ri c o m m i 1.1 e e . 

2.DD 
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03/19/86 RJM Review Assistant Secretary .3.30 
Indian Affairs'* opinion on 
t r i ba I authority iar borrowing 
at 70% of prime rate; finish 
review of Mobii jet fuel 
ana lysis 

03/19/86 LI_R Review Congress i ana 1 Record. D.ID 

03/19/86 JAD trip to DOE; revu doc.; 5.50 
Conference with CLB 

03/20/86 CAH Conference with RJÎ  re- his 
contract with otlner jet fuel 
parties (Air Products). Try to 
cal1 Bob Robertson 

0.30 

03/20/86 CLB Several conferences with JAD 
and RJM and review Gî GA 
documents preparatory to 
d r a f t i n 3 answer t o 
sal icitation. 

3.50 

D3/2D/66 RJM Discuss jet fuel venture with 
CAHJ CLB) JAD J A. Kaoros 8< Ait 
Products Co. 

3.2D 

03/20/86 

03/20/86 

L L R F3 e V 1 e 1.0 Congressional Record. 

JAD Research tax credits; 
Conference with CLB Z<. 
r eV i ew dacument.s 

CAH 

0.10 

7,30 

03/21/86 CAH Teleconference with Rich Schi 1f 0,50 
re = circumstances of M i nei~a i 
Restoration Bill; meaning of 
$300 J ODD repay clause; and 
ownership of bed 

03/21/86 FLH Conference with CLB/JAD 
water 1 aw. 

• e - D.4D 

03/21/86 CLB Conferences with JAD re= Great 
Plains project; Conference with 
F'i..H re- water rights; Drafting 
submission to DOEi Read 
mortgage. Ci-̂ ecked Congressional 
Record for further action on 
Four iBears; note to LLR re'- same 

7.80 
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0 3 / 2 1 / 8 ^ CLB Pro-rata portion a-f time spent 
on research; preparation and 
review of General Memoranda re 
evyents in Indian law. 

D. ID 

D3/21/8& RJM [Review State legislation on 
taxability of tribal municipal 
bonds; discuss with CLB> JAD. 
Review status of Indian tribes 
under SBA 6(a) program 

2.30 

03/21/86 LLR Review Congressional Record 8< 
Federa1 Reg i ster. 

0.10 

Q3/21/a<^ JAD trip to DOE; Research; 
Conference with CLB and FLH' 

6.70 

03/22/86 CLB Drafting Great Plains 
submission) Conference with 
CAH . 

5.00 

03/23/86 CLB ij r a f t i n g Great Plains 
s u b m 1 s s i a n , 

4. DD 

03/23/86 

03/24/86 

JAD 

CAH 

R e s s a r c 1 fed coal tss 

R e v i e w C L B d r a f t of 
G a 5 i f i c a t i o n m e m a > talk b r i e f l y 
to A i y c e r e : m e e t i n g tarnarrow 

1 .50 

2.80 

03/24/86 CLB Great Plains submission 
conferences and drafting. 
Conference with R J M 

4.60 

03/24/86 RJM Analyze effect of .Senate 
position on bond taxability on 
Great Plains deal; discuss with 
CLB and JAiD 

1 .40 

03/24/86 LLR Review Congressional Record. 0.10 

03/24/66 JAD draft sections of GP proj, 3.40 
draft calI ta OODi Conference 
w i th CLB S; RJM 

03/25/86 CAH Conference with Alyce S.B. re '• 
gasification; Teleconference 
with Chi2v Tada re= 
appointments tomarrow 

1 .m 
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D3/25/86 

03/25/86 

CLB Conference w i.th JAD and RJM re-
draft Great Plains submissicin; 
Read CAH camments and revise 
draft; Met with AiyceJ CAH and 
JADi Research for tribal 
history section; Began drafting 
same; Telecons with Alyce. 

RJM Analyze Senate Finance 
Committees vote on taxation of 
municipal bonds rs- Great 
Plains buy out. Letter to 
Tribe on North Dakota SMCRA 
primacy) Review BLM regulations 
on coal exchanges. Review CLB 
draft 

4.8D 

03/25/86 LLI^ Review Congress iona 

03/25/36 

iecor a . 

JAD Rewarding draft materials 
Meeting with Alyce Spotted 
Bear; CLB etc. 

D3/26/86 CAH Meeting with Alyce> CLB> RJM, 
JAD; go to Interior 8̂  meet with 
!< a a r o s > F rank R y a n > Joe 
Johnstonj i^ichard Nepiiew re-
Gasification. M e e t. i n g w i t. i-i a u r 
people again re• same 

03/26/86 C1-.B Meeting with Aiyce and John 
Charging; To BIA for meeting 
with j-'rank i?yan > i-uncheon 
conference; Office meetings 
with A, Kooros) Alyce^ CAH; JAD 
and RJM; Drafting work on memo 
to BIA and DOE submission; Met 
in late PM with A, Koor•s re• 
financing sections 

03/26/86 RJM Meeting with J. Charging; Alyce 
'Spotted Bear > A, Koorasj CLB > 
CAH) JDLH; BIA staff on Great 
Plains project 

03/26/86 LLR Review Congressional Recard. 

03/26/86 JAD Meeting with at BIA; Meeting 
with ASB) AK; CAH) RJM CLB 

2.80 

D.ID 

2.80 

3.20 

9. DO 

6 . 21.1 

D. 10 

5.20 
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D3/27/86 CAH Conference w i tl-. CLB, RJM S. JAD 2.DD 
re: prabiems in the ANG draft 
proposal . l?ev i ew memo to Frank 
Ryan re' same. Teleconference 
w i th Pau1 Good i ron 

03/27/86 CLB Review edit and confer re- DOE 5.80 
submission and memo to F. Ryan 
re- Great Plains. Conf w/RJM 

03/27/86 RJM Discuss financina of Great 2.2D 
Plains project with CLB, review 
BLM coal exchange regulations. 
Meeting with CAH, JAD 2. CLB 

03/27/86 . LLR Review Congress I anai Record re 0,30 
1 Water Resources Bill. 

03/27/86 JAD Draft amends to memo proposal, 5.70 
• U CLB, RJM; CAH; call to F 8< U, 

Ul CAH, Review file Recreation 

03/28/86 CAH Teiecanference with Ahmed with 1.20 
CLB, RJM, JAD re- Gasification, 
review andedit memo to Ryan 

03/28/86 CLB Conference call with A. KoorOB, 4.00 
RJM, CAH and JAD re- financial 
sections of submission; Edit 
submission and memo to Frani< 
Ryan, Tried to read-) ASB; 
Letter to Alyce; Teleconference 
w i t h R a y C r o s s . 

03/28/86 RJM Conference call with A. Kooros, 3.10 
CLB, CAH, JAD to discuss 
financing changes to draft. 
iDiscuss tribal position on CUJA 
iegislation with Paulette 
Hansen 

03/28/86 LLR Review Congressional Record. D . ID 

D3/28/86 JAD Telephone call to A. Kooros, ^ 5.00 
editing memo, proofreading; 
r e a d i n 9 r e c. files ^ 

03/31/86 CAH Teleconference with Bab 1 .50 
Robertson of Occidental Oil rs-
gasification; letter to li i m ; 
Conference with CLB 
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D3/31/8& CLB Compiled legislative lii story on 
Four Bears amendment; l_etter ta 
Alyce re: samei Letter to 
Dorgan re- Hause acceptance of 
amendment. Conference with CAH 
re: letter ta Mr. Rabertsani 
Rev i ew same. 

2.5D 

TOTAL SERVICES $ 23.733.5G 

CAH -- CHARLES A. HOBBS 
FLH ~ FRANCES L. HORN 
CLB - CAROL L. BARBERO 
RJM ~ ROBERT J. MARTIN 
LLR - LYNDA L. ROY 
JAD - JILL DE LA HUNT 
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DISBURSEMENTS: 

DISBURSEMENT 

Long d i stance ca i is 
Postage 
Local transportation 
Phatocapy i na 
Secretarial overtime 
Copy of Opinions 

DESCRIPTION 

MONTH OF MARCH 
MONTH OF MARCH 
MONTH OF MARCH 
MONTH OF MARCH 
MONTH OF MARCH 
MONTH OF MARCH 

TOT^ 

$ 
$ 
$ 
$ 
$ 
$ 

•^L $ 

AMOUNT 

47 . 22 
11.69 
41 .35 
221.85 
15. 37 
13.00 

350.48 


